
CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF OXNARD 
ORDINANCE NO. 3021 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF OXNARD 
REPEALING AND REENACTING ARTICLES II THROUGH XII, XV, AND 
XVI OF CHAPTER 14 OF THE OXNARD CITY CODE, PERTAINING TO 
THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE, 
CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE, INTERNATIONAL 
PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE, UNIFORM CODE FOR THE 
ABATEMENT OF DANGEROUS BUILDINGS, CALIFORNIA HISTORICAL 
BUILDING CODE, CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE, CALIFORNIA 
EXISTING BUILDINGS CODE, CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE, 
CALIFORNIA REFERENCED STANDARDS CODE, CALIFORNIA 
PLUMBING CODE, CALIFORNIA ENERGY CODE, FIRE CODES, FIRE 
SPRINKLERS. 

The City Council of the City of Oxnard does ordain as follows: 

PART 1. Articles II through XII, XV, and XVI of Chapter 14 of the Oxnard City Code are 
hereby repealed and reenacted. 

PART 2. The following acronyms are used in this ordinance to clarify the sections of the City 
Code being added or amended. 

ACI-318 

ANSI 

ASCE-7 

AWC 
SDPWS 

CAC 

CBC 

CBSC 

CEBC 

American Concrete Institute - Building Code Requirements 
for Structural Concrete, 2019 Edition. 

American National Standards Institute 

American Society of Civil Engineers - Minimum Design 
Loads for Buildings and Other Structures, 2016 Edition. 
American Wood Council - Special Design Provisions for 
Wind and Seismic, 2021 Edition. 

California Administrative Code [Title 24, Part 1 of the 
California Code of Regulations (C.C.R.)] 

California Building Code [Title 24, Part 2 of the California 
Code of Regulations (C.C.R.)] 

California Building Standards Commission 

California Existing Building Code [Title 24, Part 10 of the 
California Code of Regulations (C.C.R.)] 



CEC 

CALGreen 

CFC 

CHBC 

CMC 

CPC 

CRC 

Energy 
Code 

IAPMO 

NEC 

occ 

California Electrical Code [Title 24, Part 3 of the California 
Code of Regulations (C.C.R.)] 

California Green Building Standards Code [Title 24, Part 11 of 
the California Code of Regulations (C.C.R.)] 

California Fire Code [Title 24, Part 9 of the California Code of 
Regulations (C.C.R.)] 

California Historical Building Code [Title 24, Part 8 of the 
California Code of Regulations (C.C.R.)] 

California Mechanical Code [Title 24, Part 4 of the California 
Code of Regulations (C.C.R.)] 

California Plumbing Code [Title 24, Part 5 of the California 
Code of Regulations (C.C.R.)] 

California Residential Code [Title 24, Part 2.5 of the 
California Code of Regulations (C.C.R.)] 
California Energy Code [Title 24, Part 6 of the California 
Code of Regulations (C.C.R.)] 

International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical 
Officials 

National Electrical Code 

Oxnard City Code 

PART 3. Article II - California Building Code, Article III California Residential Code, Article 
IV - California Green Building Standards Code, Article V - Property Maintenance 
and Abatement Codes, Article VI - California Historical Building Code, Article VII -
California Electrical Code, Article VIII - California Existing Buildings Code, Article 
IX - California Mechanical Code, Article X - California Referenced Standards Code, 
Article XI - California Plumbing Code, Article XII - California Energy Code, Article 
XV - Fire Codes, Article XVI - Fire Sprinklers, are added to Chapter 14 of the 
Oxnard City Code to read as follows: 

' 2 
Ordinance No. 302 I 



ARTICLE II. CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE 

SEC. 14-2. CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE ADOPTED. 

The second part of twelve parts of the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, known as 
the California Building Code ("CBC"), 2022 Edition, including Appendices C, H, and J, as 
published by the Building Standards Commission, 2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130, 
Sacramento CA 95833-2936, is hereby adopted by reference, subject to the amendments, 
additions, and deletions hereinafter set forth. One true copy of this code is on file in the office of 
the City Clerk and is available for public inspection as required by law. 

SEC. 14-3. AMENDMENTS TO THE CBC. 

(A) Chapter 1 Division II, Section [A]l0l.4.4: Amend Section [A)lOl.4.4 to read as 
follows: 

[A)l0l.4.4. Property Maintenance. The provisions of the Oxnard City Code shall apply 
to existing structures and premises; equipment and facilities; light, ventilation, space 
heating, sanitation, life and fire safety hazards; responsibility of owners, operators and 
occupants; and occupancy of existing premises and structures. 

(B) Chapter 1 Division II, Section [A]103.1: Amend Section [A)103.1 to read as 
follows: 

[A]103.1. Creation of enforcement agency. The Building and Engineering Division of 
the Community Development Department is hereby created and the official in charge 
thereof shall be known as the building official. 

(C) Chapter 1 Division II, Section [A]l0S.2: Amend Section [A]105.2, items 2 and 4, 
to read as follows: · 

Building: 
2. Fences not over 6 feet high and concrete or masonry walls not over 3 '-6" high 

as measured from the lowest finished grade to the top of the wall. 

4. Retaining walls that are not over 3 feet in height measured from the bottom of 
the footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge or impounding 
Class I, II, or II-A liquids. 

(D) Chapter 1 Division II, Section [A]l0S.3.2: Amend Section [A]l0S.3.2, to read as 
follows: 

IAJlOS.3.2. Time limitation of application. An application for a permit for any 
proposed work shall be deemed to have been abandoned 180 days after the date of filing, 
unless such application has been pursued in good faith or a permit has been issued; 
except that the building official is authorized to grant one or more extensions of time for 

31 
Ordinance No. 3021 



additional periods not exceeding 180 days each. The extension shall be requested in 
writing and justifiable cause demonstrated. 

(E) Chapter 1 Division II, Section [A]107.1: Amend Section [A)107.1, to read as 
follows: 

[A]107.1. General. Plans, specifications, engineering cal_culations, diagrams, soil 
investigation reports, special inspection and structural observation programs and other 
data shall constitute the submittal documents and shall be submitted in one or more sets 
with each application for a permit. When such plans are not prepared by an architect or 
engineer, the Building Official may require the applicant submitting such plans or other 
data to demonstrate that state law does not require that the plans be prepared by a 
licensed architect or engineer. The Building Official may require plans, computations and 
specifications to be prepared and designed by an engineer or architect licensed by the 
state to practice as such even if not required by state law. 

EXCEPTION: The Building Official may waive the submission of plans, 
calculations, construction inspection requirements and other data if it is found that 
the nature of the work applied for is such that reviewing of plans is not necessary 
to obtain compliance with this Code. 

Computations, diagrams, schedules, soil reports, geological or geotechnical reports, 
hazardous material reports and other data sufficient to show the correctness and adequacy 
of the plans shall be submitted when required by the Building Official. 

(F) Chapter 1 Division II, Section [A]109.2: Amend Section {A]109.2, to read as 
follows: 

[A]l09.2. Schedule of permit fees. On building, structures, electrical, gas, mechanical, 
and plumbing systems or alterations requiring a permit, a fee for each permit shall be as 
set forth in the fee schedule adopted by resolution or ordinance of the City Council, in 
accordance with the most current policies and procedures as described in the Fees 
Charged to Developers document approved by the Community Development Director. 

(G) Chapter 1 Division II, Section [A]ll0.3.12: Add Section {A]ll0.3.12.3 to read as 
follows: 

[A]ll0.3.12.3. OSHPD 3 Inspection. For clinics and facilities covered by Office of 
Statewide Health Planning and development (OSHPD 3) requirements and requiring 
certification of the construction meeting OSHPD 3 requirements, prior to a final 
inspection by the building inspector, the owner shall employ an OSHPD certified 
inspector to conduct an inspection of all applicable OSHP:O 3 requirements and prepare a 
report stating that the construction fully complies to all of California's OSHPD 3 
requirements. The report shall be submitted to the building inspector for their review and 
approval prior to scheduling a final inspection for the facility. 

4 
Ordinance No. 3 021 



(H) Section 903.2: Amend Section 903.2 to read as follows: 

903.2. Where required. Approved automatic fire sprinkler systems shall be installed in 
all structures, occupancies, and locations as set forth in this section. For the purposes of 
this section, fire walls, fire barriers, and fire partitions shall not be considered as creating 
separate buildings. 

(I) Section 1403.1: Amend Section 1403.1 to read as.follows: 

1403.1. General. The provisions of this section shall apply to exterior walls, wall 
coverings and components thereof. Additionally, balconies, landings, exterior stairways, 
occupied roofs and similar surfaces exposed to the weather and sealed underneath shall 
be waterproofed.and sloped a minimum)/4 unit vertical in 12 units horizontal (2% slope) 
for drainage. The weather-exposed areas with ceilings or horizontal projections not 
required to be sealed for fire resistive construction shall be provided with ventilation 
devices so as to provide adequate air movement to dry out any moisture infiltrating 
within the horizontal areas. Details and notes on ventilation devices shall be provided in 
the submittal drawings. 

(J) Section 1505.1: Amend the first paragraph of Section 1505.1 to read as follows: 

1505.1. General. The roof covering on any structure regulated by this code shall be a 
Class A or B roof covering. The roof covering assembly includes the roof deck, 
underlayment, interlayment, insulation, and covering which is assigned a roof covering 
classification. Roof coverings required to be listed by this section shall be tested in 
accordance withASTM E 108 or UL 790. In addition, fire-retardant-treated wood roof 
coverings shall be tested in accordance withASTM D 2928. 

(K) Section 1507.3.1: Amend.Section 1507.3.1 to read as follows: 

1507.3.1. Deck Requirements. Concrete and clay tile shall be installed only over solid 
sheathing. 

(L) Section 1511.1: Amend the first paragraph of Section 1511.1 to read as follows: 

1511.1. General. All reroofing shall be constructed with Class A or B roofing and shall 
conform to the applicable provisions of Chapter 15 of this Code, or as approved by the 
building official. 

(M) Section 1613.5: Add Section 1613.5 to read as follows: 

1613.5. Amendments to ASCE 7. The provisions of Section 1613.5 shall be permitted as 
an amendment to the relevant provisions of ASCE-7. 

5 
Ordinance No. 3021 



(N) Section 1613.5.1: Add Section 1613.5.1 to read as follows: 

1613.5.1. Modification to ASCE 7 Section 12.2.3.1 Exception 3. ASCE 7 Section 
12.2.3.1, Exception 3 is modified to read as follows: 

3. Detached one-and two-family dwellings up to two stories in height of light frame 
construction. · 

(0) Section 1613.5.2: Add Section 1613.5.2 to read as follows: 

1613.5.2 Modification to ASCE 7 Section 12.11.2.2.3. ASCE 7 Section 12.11.2.2.3 is 
modified to read as follows: 

12.11.2.2.3. Wood Diaphragms. The anchorage of concrete or masonry structural 
walls to wood diaphragms shall be in accordance withAWC SDPWS 4.1.5.1 and this 
section. Continuous ties required by this section shall be in addition to the 
diaphragm sheathing. Anchorage shall not be accomplished by use of toe nails or 
nails subJect to withdrawal, nor shall wood ledgers or framing be used in cross-grain 
bending or cross-grain tension. The diaphragm sheathing shall not be considered 
effective as providing ties or struts required by this section. 

For wood diaphragms supporting concrete or masonry walls, wood diaphragms shall 
comply with the following: 

1. The spacing of continuous ties shall not exceed 40 feet. Added chords of 
diaphragms may be used to form sub-diaphragms to transmit the anchorage forces to 
the main continuous crossties. 

2. The maximum diaphragm shear used to determine the depth of the sub-diaphragm 
shall not exceed 75% of the maximum diaphragm shear. 

(P) Section 1613.5.3: Add Section 1615.3 to read as follows: 

1615.3. Modification to ASCE 7 Section 12.12.3. ASCE 7 Section 12.12.3, Equation 
12.12-1 is modified to read as follows: 

(Eq.12-12.1) 

(Q) Section 1704.6: Amend Section 1704.6 to read as follows: 

1704.6. Structural Observations. Where required by the provisions of Section 1704.6.1 
or 1704.6.2, or 1704.6;3, the owner shall employ a structural observer to perform 
structural observations. Structural observation does not include or waive the 
responsibility for the inspections in Section 110 or the special inspections in Section 1705 

6 
Ordinance No. 3021 



or other sections of this code. The structural observer shall be one of the following 
individuals: 

1. The registered design professional responsible for the structural design, or 
2. A registered design professional designated by the registered design professional 

responsible for the structural design. 

The registered .design professional responsible for the structural design shall submit to the 
building official a written statement identifying the frequency and extent of structural 
observations. This written statement shall be made part of the construction documents 
prior to permit issuance. 

At the conclusion of the work included in the permit, the structural observer shall submit 
a final report which states that all observed deficiencies have been resolved, prior to 
acceptance of the work by the building official. 

(R) Section 1705.3: Amend'Section 1705.3 to read as follows: 

1705.3. Concrete Construction. The special inspections and verifications for concrete 
construction shall be as required by this section and Table 1705.3. 

EXCEPTIONS: Special inspection and test shall not be required for: 

I. Isolated spread concrete footings of buildings three stories or less in height that are 
fully supported on earth or rock, where the structural design of the footing is based on 
a specified compressive strength, f'c, no greater than 2,500 pounds p~r square inch 
(psi) (17.2 Mpa). 

2. Continuous concrete footings supporting walls of buildings three stories or less in 
height that are fully supported on earth or rock where: 

2.1. The footings support walls oflight-frame construction; 
2.2. The footings are designed in accordance with Table 1809.7, or 
2.3. The structural design of the footing is based on a specified compressive strength, 

f'c, no greater than 2,500 pounds per square inch (psi) (17.2 Mpa), regardless of 
the compressive strength specified in the construction documents or used in the 
footing construction. 

3. Nonstructural concrete slabs supported directly on the ground, including concrete 
patios, driveways and sidewalks 

(S) Section 1705.13.2: Amend Section 1705.13.2, Exception, to read as follows: 

Exception: Special inspections are not required for wood shear walls, shear panels and 
diaphragms, including nailing, bolting, anchoring and other fastening to other elements of 
the seismic-force-resisting system, where either (1) the fastener spacing of the sheathing 

7 
OrdinanceNo. 3021 



is more than 4 incp.es (102mm) on center ( o.c.), or (2) the tabular values for allowable 
shear design values are reduced to seventy-five percent (75%). 

(T) Section 1803.2: Amend the first paragraph of Section 18_03.2 to read as follows: 

1803.2. Investigations required. -Oeotechnical investigations shall be conducted in 
accordance with Sections 1803.3 through 1803.5. Whenever unusual soil conditions are 
found which justify a special site investigation to determine soil stability or questionable 
adequacy of the overall building site, the building official may require that the owner 
obtain a special geological, hydrological, soil gas profile, soil chemical analysis, soils 
contamination, or other report as may be deemed appropriate. The investigation shall be 
conducted by trained and experienced professionals licensed by the State of California to 
prepare such evaluations, recommendations, and reports. 

(U) Section 1804.4: Amend Section 1804.4 to read as follows: 

1804.4. Site Grading. The ground immediately adjacent to the foundation shall be sloped 
away from the building at a slope of not less than one unit vertical in 50 units horizontal 
(2-percent) for a minimum distance of 10 feet (3048 mm) measured perpendicular to the 
face of the wall. If physical obstructions or lot lines prohibit 10 feet (3048 mm) of 
horizontal distance, a 2-percent slope shall be provided to an approved alternative method 
of diverting water away from the foundation. Swales used for this purpose shall be sloped 
not less than 2 percent where located within 10 feet (3048mm) of the building 
foundation. Impervious surfaces within 10 feet (3048 mm) of the building foundation 
shall be sloped not less than 2 percent away from the building. 

Exception: Impervious surfaces shall be permitted to be sloped less than 2 
percent where the surface is a door landing or ramp that is required to comply 
with Section 1010.1.4, 1012.3 or 1012.6.1. 

The procedure used to establish the final ground level adjacent to the foundation shall 
account for additional settlement of the backfill. 

Provisions shall be made for the control and drainage of surface water around buildings. 
Concentrated drainage such as rainwater from gutters and downspouts, scuppers, and roof 
valleys shall be diverted away from building foundations by means of concrete splash 
blocks or other approved non-erosive devices. Unless an alternate design is approved by 
the building official, under floor access crawl holes shall be provided with curbs 
extending not less than six (6) inches above adjacent grade to prevent surface water from 
entering the under floor area. 

Gutters and Downspouts - when buildings are located on expansive soil having an 
expansion index greater than 50, gutters, downspouts, piping, and/or other non-erosive 
devices shall be provided to collect and conduct rainwater to a street, storm drain, or other 
approved watercourse or disposal. area. 

8 
Ordinance No. 3021 



Lot Drainage - All lots shall be graded to drain to a street or public way that abuts the ,site 
or shall be provided with approved drainage devices. Minimum gradient of all lots shall 
comply with the following: 

Longitudinal CrossSlope 
1. Pervious surfaces -- I percent slope 2 percent slope 
2. Asphalt surfaces -- 1/2 percent slope 1 percent slope 
3. Concrete surfaces -- 1/4 percent slope ½ percent slope 

(2 percent = ¼ inch per foot; 1 percent = l/8" per foot; ½ percent = 1/16" per foot; 
and¼ percent= 1/32 inch per foot.) 

In rural areas where curbs or gutters have not been installed, drainage design plans shall 
be submitted for approval by the building official. 

(V) Section 1808.7.4: Amend Section 1808.7.4 to read as follows: 

1808.7.4. Foundation Elevation. The top of any exterior foundation shall extend above 
the elevation of the lowest adjacent street gutter or the inlet of an approved drainage 
device not less than 25 inches. Alternative elevations are permitted subject to approval of 
the building official, provided that it can be demonstrated that required drainage to the 
point of discharge and away from the structure is provided at all locations on the site. 

(W) Sectio_n.1905.1: Amend Section 1905.1 to read as follows: 

1905.1. General. The text of ACI 318 shall be modified as indicated in Sections 
1905.1.1 through 1905.1.11. 

(X) Section 1905.1.7: Amend Section 1905.1.7 to read as follows: 

1905.1.7. Section 14.1.4 of ACI 318 is not adopted. It is replaced with.the following: 

14.1.4- Plain concrete in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category C, D, E, 
orF. 

14.1.4.1 Structures assigned to Seismic Design Category C, D, E, or F shall not 
have elements of structural plan concrete, except as follows. 

( a) Concrete used for fill with a minimum cement content of two (2) sacks of 
Portland cement per cubic yard. 

(b) Isolated footings of .plain concrete supporting pedestals or columns are 
permitted, provided the projection of the·footing beyond the face of the 
supported member does not exceed the footing thickness. 

(c) In detached one- and two-family dwellings three stories or less in height 
and constructed with stud-bearing walls, plain concrete footings having a 
total area of longitudinal reinforcing steel of not less than 0.002 times the 

9 
Ordinance No. 3021 



gross cross-sectional area of the footing, with at least two continuous 
longitudinal reinforcing bars not smaller than No. 4 are permitted. In 
addition, where the foundation system consists of a plain concrete footing 
and a plain concrete stemwall, an additional longitudinal reinforcing bar not 
smaller than No. 4 shall ,be provided at the top of the stemwall, and vertical 
bars not less than No.4 shall be placed in the stemwall at 24" on center, with 
a standard 90 degree hook into the footing. 

(Y) Section 1905.1.9: Add Section 1905.1.9 to read as follows: 

1905.1.9. ModifyACI 318 Section 18.7.5, by adding Section 18.7.5.8 and 18.7.5.9 to 
read as follows: 

18.7.5.8 - Where the calculated point of contraflexure is not within the middle 
half of the member dear height, provide transverse reinforcement as specified in 
ACI 318 Sections 18.7.5.1, items (a) through (c), over the full height of the 
member. 

18. 7 .5 .9 -At any section where the design strength, cpP 0 , of the column is less 
than the sum of the shears Ve computed in accordance with ACI 318 Sections 
18.7.6.1 and 18.6.5.1 for all the beams framing into the column above the level 
under consideration, transverse reinforcement as specified in ACI 318 Sections 
18.7.5.1 through 18.7.5.3 shall be provided. For beams framing into opposite 
sides of the column, the moment components may be assumed to be of opposite 
sign. For the·determination of the design strength, cpP0 , of the column, these 
moments are permitted to be assumed to result from the deformation ofthe frame 
in any one principal axis. 

(Z) Section 1905.1.10: Add Section 1905.1.10 to read as follows: 

1905.1.10. Modify ACI 318 Section 18.10.4, by adding Section 18.10.4.7 to read as 
follows: 

18.10.4.7-Walls and portions of walls with Pu> 0.35P0 shall not be considered to 
contribute to the calculated shear strength of the structure for resisting 
earthquake-induced forces. Such walls shall conform to the requirements of ACI 
318 Section 18.14. 

(AA) Section 1905.1.11: Add Section 1905.1.11 to read as follows: 

1905.1.11. Modify ACI 318, by adding section 18.12.6.2 as follows: 

18.12.6.2 - Collector and boundary elements in topping slabs placed over precast 
floor and roof elements shall not be less than 3 inches (76mm) or 6 db thick, 
where dbis the diameter of the largest reinforcement in the topping slab. 

(BB) Section 2304.10.2: Amend Section 2304.10.2 to read as follows: 

10 
Ordinance No. 3021 



2304.10.2. Fastener requirements. Connections for wood members shall be designed in 
accordance with the appropriate methodology in Section 2302.1. The number and size of 
fasteners connecting wood members shall not be less than that set forth in Table 
2304.10.1. Staple fasteners in Table 2304.10.1 shall not be used to resist or transfer 
seismic forces in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E, or F. 

Exception: Staples may be used to resist or transfer seismic forces when the 
allowable shear values are substantiated by cyclic testing and approved by the 
building official. 

(CC) Section 2304.10.3.1: Add Section 2304.10.3.1 to read as follows: 

2304.10.3.1. Quality of Nails. Mechanically driven nails used in wood structural panel 
shear walls shall meet the same dimensions as that required for hand-driven nails, 
including diameter, minimum length, and minimum head diameter. Clipped head or box 
nails are not permitted in new construction. The allowable design value for clipped head 
nails in existing construction may be taken at no more than the nail;..head-area ratio of that 
of the same size hand-driven nails. 

(DD) Section 2305.4: Add Section 2305.4·to read as follows: 

2305.4. Hold-down connectors. In Seismic Design Category D, E, orF, hold-down 
connectors shall be designed to resist shear wall overturning moments using approved 
cyclic load values or 75 percent of the allowable seismic load values that do not consider. 
cyclic loading of the product. Connector bolts into wood framing shall require steel plate 
washers on the post on the opposite side of the anchorage device. Plate size shall be a 
minimum of0.229 inch by 3 inches by 3 inches (5.82 mm by 76 mm by 76mm) in size. 
Hold-down connectors shall be tightened to finger tight plus one half (1/2) wrench turn 
just prior to covering the wall framing. 

(EE) Section 2306.2: Amend Section 2306.2 to read as follows: 

2306.2. Wood-frame diaphragms. Wood-frame diaphragms shall be designed and 
constructed in accordance withAWC SDPWS. Where panels are fastened to framing 
members with staples, requirements and limitations of AWC SDPWS shall be met and 
the allowable shear values set forth in Table 2306.2(1) or 2306.2(2) shall only be 
permitted for structures assigned to Seismic Design Category A, B, or C. 

Exception: Allowable shear values where panels are fastened to framing 
members with staples may be used if such values are substantiated by cyclic 
testing and approved by the building official. 

The allowable shear values in Tables 2306.2(1) and 2306.2(2) are permitted to be 
increased 40 percent for wind design. · 

Wood structural panel diaphragms used to resist seismic forces in structures assigned to 
Seismic Design Category D, E, or F ·shall be applied directly to the framing members. 

11 
Ordinance No. 3021 



Exception: Wood structural panel diaphragms are permitted to be fastened over 
solid lumber planking or laminated decking, provided the panel joints and lumber 
planking or laminated decking joints do not coincide. 

(FF) Section 2306.3: Amend 'Section 2306.3 to read as follows: 

2306.3. Wood-frame shear walls. Wood-frame shearwalls shall be designed and 
constructed in accordance withAWC SDPWS. For structures assigned to Seismic Design 
Category D, E, or F, application of Tables 4.3A and 4.3B of AWC SDPWS shall include 
the following: 

1. Wood structural panel thickness for shear walls shall not be less than 3/8 inch 
thick and studs shall not be spaced at more than 16 inches on center. 

2. The maximum nominal unit shear capacities for 3/8 inch wood structural 
panels resisting seismic forces in structures assigned to Seismic Design 
Category D, E, or F is 400 pounds per linear foot (plf), .and shall not exceed 
200 pounds per linear foot (plf) for plywood structural panels containing three 
or fewer laminated layers. 

Exception: Other nominal unit shear capacities may be permitted if such 
values are substantiated by cyclic testing and approved by the building 
official. 

3. Where shear design values using allowable stress design (ASD) exceed 350 
plf or load and resistance factor design (LRFD) exceed 500 plf, all framing 
members receiving edge nailing from abutting .panels shall not be less than a 
single 3-inch nominal member or two 2-inch nominal members fastened 
together in accordance with Section 2306.1 to transfer the design shear value 
between framing members. Wood structural panel joint and sill plate nailing 
shall be staggered at all panel edges. See Section 4.3.6.1 and 4.3.6.4.3 of 
AWC SDPWS for sill plate size and anchorage requirements. 

4. Nails shall be placed not less than 1/2 inch in from the panel edges and not 
less than 3/8 inch from the edge of the connecting members for shear greater 
than 350 plf using ASD or 500 plfusing LRFD; Nails shall be placed not less 
than 3/8 inch from panel edges and not less than 1/4 inch from the edge of the 
connecting member for shears of 350 plf or less using ASD or 500 plf or less 
usingLRFD. 

5. Table 4.3B application is not allowed for structures assigned to Seismic 
Design Category D, E, or F. 

For structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, application of Table 4.3C of AWC 
SDPWS shall not be used below the top level in a multi-level building, and the allowable 
seismic shear values shall not exceed 90 plf for Portland cement plaster and 30 plf for 

12 
Ordinance·No. 3021 



gypsum. Table 4.3C shall not be allowed for structures assigned to Seismic Design 
Category E, or F. 

Where panels are fastened to framing members with staples, requirements and limitations 
of AWC SDPWS shall be met and the allowable shear values set forth in Table 2306.3(1), 
2306.3(2) or 2306.3(3) shall only be permitted for structures assigned to Seismic Design 
Category A, B, or C. 

Exception: Allowable shear values where panels are fastened to framing 
members with staples may be used if such values are substantiated by cyclic 
testing and approved by the building official. 

The allowable shear values in Table 2306.3(1 ), 2306.3(2) are permitted to be increased 40 
percent for wind design. Panels complying with ANSI/APA PRP-210 shall be permitted 
to use design values for Plywood Siding in the AWC SDPWS. 

Exception: [DSA-SS DSA-SS/CC and OSHPD 1,2,&4] Wood structural panel 
walls using staples as fasteners are not permitted by DSA and OSHPD. 

(GG) Section 2307.2: Add Section 2307.2 to read as follows: 

2307.2. Wood-frame shear walls. Wood-frame shear walls shall be designed and 
constructed in accordance with Section 2306.3 as applicable. 

(11H) Table 2308.6.1: Amend Table 2308.6.1 by modifying footnote "b" to read as 
follows: 

b. See section 2308.6.3 for full description of bracing methods. Bracing methods 
DWB, SFB, PBS, HPS, and GB are not permitted in Seismic Design Categories D 
orE. 

(II) Section 2308.6.8.1: Amend Section 2308.6.8.1, first Exception, to read as 
follows: 

Exception: For structures in Seismic Design Category A, B, or C, with a maximum plan 
dimension not more than 50 feet (15 240mm), continuous foundations are required at 
exterior walls only. 

(JJ) Section 2308.6.9: Amend Section 2308.6.9 to read as follows: 

2308.6.9. Attachment of Sheathing. Fastening of braced wall panel sheathing shall not 
be les than that prescribed in Table 2308.6.1 or Table 2304.10.1. Wall sheathing shall not 
be attached to framing members by adhesives. Staple fasteners in Table 2304.10.1 shall 
not be used to resist or transfer seismic forces in structures assigned to Seismic Design 
Category D, E, or F. 

13 
Ordinance No. 3021 



Exceptim~: Staples may be used to resist or transfer seismic forces when the 
allowable shear values are substantiated by cyclic testing and approved by the 
building official. 

(KK) Appendix Chapter J, Section J103.2, Exception 1: Amend Appendix Chapter 
J, Section J103.2, Exception 1, to read as follows: 

1. Grading in an isolated, self-contained area, provided there is no danger to the 
public, the total quantity of graded soil does not exceed 150 cubic yards, and 
that such grading will not adversely affect adjoining properties. 

(LL) Appendix Chapter J, Section J104.1: Amend Appendix Chapter J, Section 
J104.1 to read as follows: 

J104.1. Submittal Requirements. Application for a grading permit shall be 
accompanied by four sets of plans and specifications, and supporting data consisting of a 
soils engineering report (and an engineering geology report where required by the 
Building Official.) The sets of plans submitted for final approval shall be submitted on 
mylar. The plans and specifications shall be prepared and signed by an individual 
licensed by the state to prepare such plans or specifications when required by the building 
official. The dates of the soils engineering (and engineering geology report if required) 
along with the names, addresses, and phone numbers of the firms or individuals who 
prepared the reports, shall appear on the grading plans. In addition to the provisions of 
Section 105.3, and 1.8.4, as applicable, the applicant shall state the estimated quantities 
of excavation and fill. 

ARTICLE III. CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE 

SEC. 14-4. CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE ADOPTED. 

The part 2.5 of twelve parts of the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, known as the 
California Residential Code ("CRC"), 2022 Edition, including Appendix AH and AQ, as 
published by the Building Standards Commission, 2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130, 
Sacramento CA 95833-2936, is hereby adopted by reference, subject to the amendments, 
additions, and deletions hereinafter set forth. One true copy of this code is on file in the office of 
the City Clerk and is available for public inspection as required by law. 

SEC. 14~5. AMENDMENTS TO THE CRC. 

(A) Chapter One-Division II ADMINISTRATION. Except for Sections 101.1, 
101.2, and 101.3, entitled "Title," "Scope," and "Purpose," Chapter One, entitled 
"Division II Administration" is hereby deleted from the CRC. The Administrative Code 
as adopted in the Oxnard City Code, Chapter 14, Article II, shall apply to this Article. 

(B) Section R301.2.2.11: Add Section R301.2.2.11 to read as follows: 

14 
Ordinance No. 3021 



R301.2.2.11. Anchorage of mechanical, electrical, or plumbing components and 
equipment. M~hanical, electrical, or plumbing components and equipment shall be 
anchored to the structure. Anchorage of the components and equipment shall be designed 
to resist loads in accordance with the California Building Code and ASCE7, except where 
the component is positively attached to the structure and flexible connections are 
provided between the component and associated ductwork, piping, and conduit; and 
either: 

1. The component weighs 400 lb. or less and has a center of mass located 4ft. or 
less above the supporting structure; or 

2. The component weighs 20 lb"' or less or, in the case of a distributed system, 5 
lb/ft or less. 

(C) Section R313: Add Section R313 to read as follows: 

~13. General. Approved automatic fire extinguishing systems shall be installed and 
maintained in accordance with Chapter 14 of the Oxnard City Code, Article XVI. · 

(D) Section R401.1: Amend the Exception to Section R401.1 to read as follows: 

Exception: Wood foundation~ in Seismic Design Categories D0,. Di, and D2 shall 
not be permitted. The provisions of this chapter shall be pennitted to be used for 
wood foundations only in the following situations: 
1. In non-occupied, single-story, detached storage sheds and similar uses other 
than carport or garage, provided, the gross floor area does not exceed 200 square 
feet, the plate height does not exceed 12 feet in height above the grade plane at 
any point, and the maximum roof projection does not exceed 24 inches. 

(E) Section R403.1.2: Amend Section R403.1.2 to read as follows: 

R403.1.2. Continuous footing in Seismic Design Categories Do, Di, and D2• The 
braced wall panels at exterior walls of buildings located in Seismic Design Categories D0, 

D1, and D2 shall be supported by continuous footings. All required interior braced wall 
panels in buildings shall be supported by continuous footings. 

(F) Section R403.1.3.6: Section R403.1.3.6 is deleted in its entirety. 

(G) Section R404.2: Amend Section R404.2 to read as follows: 

R404.2. Wood foundation walls. Wood foundation walls shall be constructed in 
accordance with the provisions of Sections R404.2.1 through R404.2.6 and with details , 
shown in Figures R403.1(2) and R403.1(3). Wood foundation walls shall not be used for, 
structures located in Seismic Design Category D0, Di, and D2• 

(H) Table R602.3(1): Amend Table R602.3(1) by adding footnote "j" to be 
applicable to the entire table and to read as follows: 

15 
Ordinance No. 3021 



j. Use of staples in braced wall panels shall be prohibited in Seismic Design 
Category D0, Di, and D2• 

(I) Table R602.3(2): Amend Table R602.3(2) by revising footnote "b" to read as 
follows: · 

b. Staples shall have a minimum crown width of 7 /16-inch diameter except as 
noted .. Use of staples in roof, floor, subfloor, and braced wall panels shall be 
prohibited in Seismic Design Category D0, D1, and D2_ 

(J) Table R602.10.3(3): Amend Table R602.10.3(3) to read as follows: 
TABLE R602.10.3(3) 

BRACING REQUIREMENTS BASED ON SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY 

SOIL CLASS oa 
WALL HEIGHT= 10 FT 

10 PSF FLOOR DEAD LOAD MINIMUM TOTAL LENGTH (feet} OF 

15 PSF ROOF/CEILING DEAD LOAD BRACED WALL PANELS REQUIRED ALONG 
BRACEDW EACH BRACED WALL LINEI> 

Seismic Method LIB, 
Design DWB, SFB, Methodsc 
Cate~ry Braced Wall PBS, and GB and Method Continuous 
(SOC} Storv Locatia, Line Lenath HPS PCP wspd Sheathingd 

~ 
10 NP 8.0 2.5 
20 NP 16.0 5 .0 • 30 NP 24.0 7 .5 
40 NP 32.0 10.0 

SCDD2 50 NP 40.0 12.5 
10 NP NP 5 .5 

~ 
20 NP NP 11 .0 

er 30 NP NP 16.5 
40 NP NP 22.0 
50 NP NP 27.5 

a. Wall bracing lenglhs ars bas eel on a sol site class "D." Interpolation of bracing length between the 
Sd., values associated with the seismic design categories sl,all be permilled when a site-specific Sd~ 
value'fuleternined in accordance with Section 16 

b. Foundation cripple wall panels shall be braced In accordance with Section R602.10.9 

c. Methods GB and PCP braced wall panel h/w ra11o shall not exceed 1:1. 

d. Wood Structural Panel shall have a ninimum lhlcknes~ In SOC~ of 15/32" , and shall not be atlached 
using staples . 

(I{) Table R602.10.4: Amend Table R602.10.4 by adding footnote "f'' to be 
applicable to the entire table and to read as follows: 

2.1 
4.3 
6.4 
8.5 
10.6 
4.7 
9.4 
14.0 
16.7 
23.5 

£ Use of staples in braced wall panels shall be prohibited in Seismic Design 
Category D0, D1, and D2. 

(L) Section R703.1: Amend Section R703.1 to read as follows: 

16 
Ordinance No. 3021 



R703.l. General. Exterior walls shali provide the building with a weather-resistant 
exterior wall e~velope. The exterior wall envelope shall included flashing as described in 
Section R 703 A Additionally, balconies, landings, exterior stairways, occupied roofs and 
similar surfaces exposed to the weather and sealed underneath shall be waterproofed and 
sloped a minimum 1/4 unit vertical in 12 units horizontal (2% slope) for drainage. The 
weather-exposed areas with ceilings or horizontal projections not required to be sealed 
for fire resistive construction shall be provided with ventilation devices so as to provide 
adequate air movement to dry out any moisture infiltrating within the horizontal areas. 
Details and notes on ventilation devices shall be provided in the submittal drawings. 

(M) Section R902.l: Amend the first paragraph of Section R902.1 to read as follows: 

R902.1. Roofing covering materials. Roofs shall be covered with materials as set forth 
in Sections R904 and R905. A minimum Class A or B roofing shall be installed in areas 
designated by this section or where the edge of the roof is less than 3 feet from a lot line. 
Class A or B roofing required by this section shall be tested in accordance with UL 790 
or ASTM E108. 

(N) Section R902.1.2: Amend Section R902.l.3 to read as follows: 

R902.1.3. Roof coverings in all other areas. All reroofing shall be constructed with 
Class A or B roofing and shall conform to the applicable provisions of this Chapter, or as 
approved by the building official. 

(0) Appendix Chapter AH, Section AH103.2: Amend Appendix Chapter AH, 
Section AH103.2 to read as follows: 

AH 103.2. Light, ventilation and emergency egress. Exterior openings required for 
light and ventilation shall be permitted to open into a patio structure conforming to 
Section AHl O 1. Where such exterior openings serve as an exit from the dwelling unit, 
the patio structure, unless unenclosed, shall be provided with exits conforming to the 
provisions of Section R3 l 1 of this code. Emergency egress or rescue openings from 
sleeping rooms shall not open into a patio structure. 

(P) Appendix Chapter AQ, Section AQ106: Appendix Chapter AQ, Section AQ106 
is deleted in its entirety. 

17 
Ordinance·No. 3021 



ARTICLE rv. CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE . 

SEC. 14-6. CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE ADOPTED . 

The part eleven oftwelve parts of the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, known as 
the California Green Building Standards Code ("CALGreen"), 2022 Edition, as published by the 
California Building Standards Commission, 2524 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130, Sacramento, 
CA 95833-2936, is hereby adopted by reference, subject to the amendments, additions, and 
deletions hereinafter set forth. One true copy of this code is on file in the office of the City Clerk 
and is available for public inspection as required by law. 

ARTICLE V. PROPERTY MAINTENANCE AND ABATEMENT CODES 

SEC. 14-8. INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE AND UNIFORM 
CODE FOR THE ABATEMENT OF DANGEROUS BUILDINGS ADOPTED. 

The International Property Maintenance Code, 2021 Edition, and the Uniform Code for 
Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, 1997 Edition, as published respectively by the International 
Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor, Washington, D.C. 20001, and the 
International Conference of Building Officials, 5360 South Workman Mill Road, Whittier, 
California 90601, are hereby adopted by reference. One true copy of these codes is on file in the 
office of the City Clerk and is available for public inspection as required by law. 

SEC. 14-9. AMENDMENTS. 

(A) Section 101.1: Amend Section 101.1 to read as follows: 

101.1. Title. These regulations shall be known as the Oxnard Property Maintenance Code 
(OPMC), hereinafter referred to as "this code". 

(B) Section 103.l: Amend Section 103.1 to read as follo,vs: 

103.1. Creation of Agency. The Code Compliance Division is hereby created and the 
official in charge thereof shall be known as the code official. The function of the agency 
shall be in the implementation, administration and enforcement of the provisions of this 
code. 

(C) Section 201.3: Amertd Section 201.3 to read as follows: 

201.3. Terms Defined in Other Codes. Where terms .are not defined in this code and are· 
defined in the California Building Standards Code or NFPA 70, such terms shall have the 
meanings ascribed to them as stated in those codes. 

(D) Section 302.4: Amend Section 302.4 to read as follows: 

18 
Ordinance No. 3021 



302.4. Weeds. Premises and exterior property shall be maintained free from weeds or 
plant growth in excess of twelve (12) inches. Noxious weeds shall be prohibited. Weeds 
shall be defined as all grasses, annual plants and vegetation, other than.trees or shrubs 
provided; however, this term shall not include cultivated flowers and gardens. 

Upon failure of the owner or agent having charge of a property to cut and destroy weeds 
after service of a notice of violation, they shall be subject to prosecution in accordance 

with Section 108.3 and as prescribed by the authority.having jurisdiction. Upon failure to 
comply with the notice of violation any duly authorized employee of the jurisdiction shall 

be authorized to enter upon the property in violation and cut and destroy the weeds 

growing thereon, and the costs of such removal shall be paid by the owner or agent 
responsible for the property. 

(E) Section 302.8: Amend Section 302.8 to read as follows: 

302.8. Motor Vehicles. Except as provided for in other regulations, inoperative, 
unregistered, or unlicensed motor vehicles, motorcycles, vessels or trailers shall not be 
parked, kept, or stored on any premises, and shall not at any time be in a state of major 
disassembly, disrepair, or in the process of being stripped or dismantled. Painting of 
motor vehicles, motorcycles, vessels or trailers is prohibited unless conducted inside an 
approved spray booth. 

Exception. A vehicle of any type is permitted to undergo major overhaul, 
including body work, provided that such work is performed inside a structure or 

similarly enclosed area designed and approved for such purposes. 

(F) Section 304.1.1: Amend the first sentence of Section 304.1.1 to read as follows: 

304.1.1. Unsafe Conditions. The following conditions shall be determined as unsafe and 
shall be repaired or replaced to comply with the California Building Standards Code as 
required for existing buildings: 

(G) Section 304.14: Amend Section 304.14 to read as·follows: 

304.14. Insect Screens. Every door, window and other outside opening required for 
ventilation of habitable rooms, food preparation areas, food service areas or any areas 
where products to be included or utilized in food for human consumption are processed, 
manufactured, packaged or stored shall be supplied with approved tightly fitting screens 
of minimum 16 mesh per inch (16 mesh per 25 mm), and every screen doors used for 
insect control shall have ·a self closing device in good working condition. 

Exception. Screens shall not be required where other approved means, such as air 
curtains or insect repellant fans, are employed. 

19 
Ordinance No. 3021 1 



(H) Section 305.1.1 : Amend the first sentence of Section 305.1.1 to read as follows: 

305.1.1. Unsafe Conditions. The following conditions shall be determined as unsafe and 
shall be repaired or replaced to comply with the California Building Standards Code as 
required for existing buildings: 

(I) Section 306.1.1: Amend the first sentence of Section 305.1.1 to read as follows: 

306.1.1. Unsafe Conditions. Where any of the following conditions cause the component 
or system to be beyond its limit state, the component or system shall be determined as 
unsafe and shall be required or replaced to comply with the California Building Standards 
Code as required for existing buildings: 

(J) Section 401.3: Amend Section 401.3 to read as follows: 

401.3. Alternative Devices. In lieu of the means for natural light and ventilation herein 
prescribed, artificial light or mechanical ventilation complying with the California 
Building Standards Code shall be permitted. 

(K) Section 502.5: Amend Section 502.5 to read as follows: 

502.5. Public Toilet Facilities. Public toilet facilities shall be maintained in a safe, 
sanitary and working condition in accordance with the California Plumbing Code. Except 
for periodic maintenance or cleaning, public access and use shall be provided to the toilet 
facilities at all times during occupancy of the premises. 

(L) Section 505.1: Amend Section 505.1 to read as follows: 

505.1. General. Every sink, lavatory, bathtub or shower, drinking fountain, water closet 
or other plumbing fixture shall be properly connected to either a public water system or 
to an approved private water system. Kitchen sinks, lavatories, laundry facilities, bathtubs 
and showers shall be supplied with hot or tempered and cold running water in accordance 
with the California Plumbing Code. 

(M) Section 505.5.1: Amend Section 505.5.1 to read as follows: 

505.5.1. Abandonment of Systems. Where a nonpotable water reuse system or a 
rainwater collection and distribution system is not maintained or the owner ceases use of 
the system, the system shall be abandoned in accordance with the California Plumbing 
Code. 

(N) Section 602.2: Amend Section 602.2 to read as follows: 

602.2. Residential Occupancies. Dwellings shall be provided with heating facilities 
capable of maintaining a room temperature of 68"F (20°C) in all habitable rooms, 
bathrooms and toilet rooms. Cooking appliances shall not be used, nor shall portable 
unvented fuel-burning space heaters be used, as a means to provide required heating. The 

20 
Ordinance No. 3021 



installation of one or more portable space heaters shall not be used to achieve compliance 
with this section. 

Exception: In areas where the average monthly temperature is above 30'f (-1 °C), 
a minimum temperature of 65'f (l 8°C) shall be maintained. 

(0) Section 602.3: Amend Section 602.3 to read as follows: 

602.3. Heating Supply. Every owner and operator of any building who rents, leases or 
lets one or more dwelling units or sleeping units on terms, either expressed or implied, to 
furnish heat to the occupants thereof shall supply heat to maintain a minimum 
temperature of 68°F (20°C) in all habitable rooms, bathrooms and toilet rooms. 

(P) Section 602.4: Amend Section 602.4 to read as follows: 

602.4. Occupiable Work Spaces. Indoor occupiable works spaces shall be supplied with 
heat to maintain a minimum temperature of 65"F (l 8°C) during the period the spaces are 
occupied. 

Exceptions: 
1. Processing, storage and operation areas that require cooling or special 

temperature conditions. 
2. Areas in which persons are primarily engaged in vigorous physical 

activities. 

(Q) Section 604.3.1.1: Amend the first sentence of Section 604.3.1.1 to read as 
follows: 

604.3.1.1. Electrical Equipment. Electrical distribution equipment, motor circuits, 
power equipment, transformers, wire, cable, flexible cords, wiring devices, ground fault 
circuit interrupters, surge protectors, molded case circuit breakers, low-voltage fuses, 
luminaires, ballasts, motos and electronic control, signaling and communication 
equipment that have been exposed to water shall be replaced in accordance with the 
provisions of the California Electrical Code. 

(R) Section 604.3.2.1: Amend the first sentence of Section 604.3.2.l to read as 
follows: 

·604.3.2.1. Electrical Equipment. Electrical switches, receptacles and fixtures, including 
furnace, water heating, security system and power distribution circuits, that have been 
exposed to fire, shall be replaced in accordance with the provisions of the California 
Electrical Code. 

(S) Section 702.1: Amend Section 702.1 to read as follows: 

21 
Ordinance No. 3021 



702.1. General. A safe, continuous and unobstructed path of travel shall be provided 
from any point in a building or structure to the public way. Means of egress shall comply 
with the California Fire Code. 

(T) Section 702.2 Aisles: Amend Section 702.2 Aisles to read as follows: 

702.2. Aisles. The required width of aisles in accordance with the California Fire Code 
shall be unobstructed. 

(U) Section 702.3: Amend Section 702.3 to read as follows: 

702.3. Locked Doors. Means of egress doors shall be readily openable from the side 
from which egress is to be made without the need for keys, special lmowledge or effort, 
except where the door hardware conforms to that permitted by the California Building 
Code. 

(V) Section 702.4: Amend Section 702.4 to read as follows: 

702.4 Emergency Escape and Rescue Openings. Required emergency and rescue 
openings shall be maintained in accordance with the code in effect at the time of 
construction, and both of the following: 

1. Required emergency escape and rescue openings shall be operational from the 
inside of the room without the use of keys or tools. 

2. Bars, grilles, grates or similar devices are permitted to be placed over emergency 
escape and rescue openings provided that the minimum net clear opening size 
complies with the code that was in effect at the time of construction and the unit is 
equipped with smoke alarms installed in accordance with the California Building 
Code. Such devices shall be releasable or removable from the inside without the 
use of a key, tool or force greater than that which is required for normal operation 
of the escape and rescue opening. 

(W) Section 703.2: Amend Section 703.2 to read as follows: 

703.2 Unsafe Conditions. Where any components are not maintained and do not 
function as intended or do not have the fire resistance required by the code under which 
the building was constructed or altered, such components or portions thereof shall be 
deemed unsafe conditions in accordance with the California FireCode. Components or 
portions thereof determined to be unsafe shall be repaired or replaced to conform to the 
code under which the building was constructed or altered. Where the condition of 
components is such that any building, structure or portion thereof presents an imminent 
danger to the occupants of the building, structure or portion there, the fire code official 
shall act in accordance with the California Fire Code. 

(X) Section 703.7: Amend Section 703.7 to read as follows: 

22 
Ordinance No. 3021 



703.7. Vertical Shafts. Interior vertical shafts, including stairways, elevator hoistways 
and service and utility shafts, which connect two or more stories of a building shall be 
enclosed or protected as required by the California Fire Code. New floor openings in 
existing buildings shall comply with the California Building Code. 

(Y) Section 704.1: Amend Section 704.1 to read as follows: 

704.1. Inspection, Testing and Maintenance. Fire protection and life safety systems 
shall be maintained in accordance with the California Fire Code in an operative condition 
at all times, and shall be replaced or repaired where defective. 

(Z) Section 704.1.1: Amend Section 704.1.1 to read as follows: 

704.1.1. Fire Protection and Life Safety Systems. Fire protection and life safety 
systems shall be installed, repaired, operated and maintained in accordance with this code 
the California Fire Code and the California Building Code. 

(AA) Section 704.1.2: Amend Section 704.1.2 to read as follows: 

704.1.2. Required Fire Protection and Life Safety Systems. Fire protection and life 
safety systems required by this code, the California Fire Code or the California Building 
Code shall be installed, repaired, operated, tested and maintained in accordance with this 
code. A fire protection and life safety system for which a design option, exception or 
reduction to the provisions of this code, the California Fire Code or the California 
Building Code has been granted shall be considered a required system. 

(BB) Section 704.1.3: Amend Section 704.1.3 to read as follows: 

704.1.3. Fire Protection Systems. Fire protection systems shall be inspected, maintained 
and tested in accordance with the California Fire Code requirements. 

(CC) Section 704.3: Amend Section 704.3 to read as follows: 

704.3. Systems Out of Service. Where a required fire protection system is out of service, 
the fire department and the fire code official shall be notified immediately and, where 
required by the fire code official, either the building shall be evacuated or an approved 
fire watch shall be provided for all occupants left unprotected by he shutdown until the 
fire protection system has been returned to service. Where utilized, fire watches shall be 
provided with not less than one approved means for notification of the fire department 
and shall not have duties beyond performing constant patrols of the protected premises 
and keeping watch for fires. Actions shall be taken in accordance with the California Fire 
Code to bring the systems back in service. 

23 
Ordinance No. 3021 



Exception: Facilities with an approved notification and impairment management 
program. The notification and impairment program for water-based fire protection 
systems shall comply with NFPA 25. 

(DD) Section 704.3.1: Amend Section 704.3.1 to read as follows: 

704.3.1. Emergency Impairments. Where unplanned impairments of fire protection 
systems occur, appropriate emergency action shall be taken to minimize potential injury 
and damage. The impairment coordinator shall implement the steps outlined in the 
California Fire Code. 

(EE) Section 704.4.2: Amend Section 704.4.2 to read as follows: 

704.4.2. Removal of existing occupant-use hose lines. The Fire Code Official is 
authorized to permit the removal of existing occupant-use hose lines where all of the 
following apply: 

1. The installation is not required by the California Fire Code or the California 
Building Code. 

2. The hose line would not be used by trained personnel or the fire department. 
3. The remaining outlets are compatible with local fire department fittings. 

(FF) Section 704.4.3: Amend Section 704.4.3 to read as follows: 

704.4.3. Termination of Monitoring Service. For fire alarm systems required to be 
monitored by the California Fire Code, notice shall be made to the fire code official 
whenever alarm monitoring services are terminated. Notice shall be made in writing by 
the provider of the monitoring service being terminated. 

(GG) Section 704.5.1: Amend Section 704.5.1 to read as follows: 

704.5.1. Fire Department Connection Access. Ready access to the fire department 
connections shall be maintained at all times and without obstruction by fences, bushes, 
trees, walls or any other fixed or movable objects. Access to fire department connections 
shall be approved by the fire chief. 

Exception: Fences, where provided with an access gate equipped with a sign 
complying with the California Fire Code and a means of emergency operation. 
The gate and the means of emergency operation shall be approved by the fire 
chief and maintained operational at all times. 

(HH) Section 704.6.4: Amend Section 704.6.4 to read as follows: 

704.6.4. Smoke Detection System. Smoke detectors listed in accordance with UL 268 
and provided as part of the building's fire alarm system shall be an acceptable alternative 
to single- and multiple-station smoke alarms and shall comply with the following: 

24 
Ordinance No. 3 02 I 



1. The fire · alarm system shall comply with all applicable requirements of the 
California Fire Code. 

2. Activation of a smoke detector in a dwelling or sleeping unit shall initiate alarm 
notification in the dwelling or sleeping unit in accordance with the California Fire 
Code. 

3. Activation of a smoke detector in a dwelling or sleeping unit shall not activate 
alarm notification appliances outside of the dwelling or sleeping unit, provided 
that a supervisory signal is generated and monitored in accordance with the 
California Fire Code. 

(Il) Section 705.1: Amend Section 705.1 to read as follows: 

705.1. General. Carbon monoxide alarms shall be installed in dwellings in accordance 
with the California Fire Code, except that alarms in dwellings covered by the California 
Residential Code shall be installed in accordance with Section R315 of that code. 

ARTICLE VI. CALIFORNIA IDSTORICAL BUILDING CODE 

SEC. 14-10. CALIFORNIA lllSTORICAL BUILDING CODE ADOPTED. 

The eighth part of twelve parts of the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, known as 
the California Historical Building Code ("CHBC"), 2022 Edition, including Appendix A, as 
published by the Building Standards Commission, 2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130, 
Sacramento CA 95833-2936, is hereby adopted by reference. One true copy of this code is on 
file in the office of the City Clerk and is available for public inspection as required by law. 

ARTICLE VII. CALIFORNIA ELECTRIC~ CODE 

SEC. 14-11. CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE ADOPTED. 

The third part of twelve parts of the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, known as 
the California Electrical Code ("CEC"), 2022 Edition, which incorporates by reference the 
National Electrical Code ("NEC"), 2020 Edition, published by the Building Standards 
Commission, 2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130, Sacramento CA 95833-2936, is hereby 
adopted by reference, subject to the amendments hereinafter set forth. One true copy of this code 
is on file in the office of the City Clerk and is available for public inspection as required by law. 

SEC.14-12. AMENDMENTS. 

(A) Article 90-10: Add Article 90-10 to read as follows: 

25 
Ordinance No. 3021 



Article 90-10. Administration. The legal jurisdiction and administration of this 
electrical code is regulated by the administrative sections as adopted in Chapter 14, 
Article II of the Oxnard City Code. 

(B) Article 695.3: Amend Article 695.3 to read as follows: 

Article 695.3. Power Source(s) for Electric Motor-Driven Fire Pumps. Electric 
motor-driven fire pumps shall have a reliable source of power. Power provided by the 
local serving utility company shall only be considered a reliable source of power where 
an onsite generator is provided as an alternate source of power. [OSHP D 1, IR, 2, 3, 4, & 
5] Such reliable source of power shall consist of a normal source and an onsite generator 
as the alternate source. 

ARTICLE VIII. CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE 

SEC. 14-13. CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE ADOPTED. 

The tenth part of eleven parts of the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, known as 
the California Existing Buildings Code ("CEBC"), 2022 Edition, as published by the Building 
Standards Commission, 2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130, Sacramento CA 95833-2936, is 
hereby adopted by reference. One true copy of this code is on file in the office of the City Clerk 
and is available for public inspection as required by law. 

ARTICLE IX. CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE 

SEC. 14-14. CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE ADOPTED. 

The fourth part of eleven parts of the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, known as 
the California Mechanical Code ("CMC''), 2022 Edition, and Appendices B and C thereof, and 
Standards contained therein, published by the Building Standards Commission, 2525 Natomas 
Park Drive, Suite 130, Sacramento CA 95833-2936, is hereby adopted by reference, subject to 
the amendment hereinafter set forth. One true copy of this code is on file in the office of the City 
Clerk and is available for public inspection as required by law. 

SEC. 14-15. AMENDMENT. 

(A) Chapter One, Division II-Administration. Except for Sections 101.1, 101.2, and 
101.3, entitled "Title," "Purpose," and "Scope," Chapter One, Division II entitled 
"Administration" is hereby deleted from the CMC. The Administrative Code as adopted 
in the Oxnard City Code, Chapter 14, Article II, shall apply to this Article. 

26 
Ordinance No. 3021 



ARTICLE X. CALIFORNIA REFERENCED STANDARDS CODE 

SEC. 14-16. CALIFORNIA REFERENCED STANDARDS CODE ADOPTED. 

The twelfth part of twelve parts of the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, known as 
the California Referenced Standards Code ("CRSC"), 2022 Edition, as published by the Building 
Standards Commission, 2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130, Sacramento CA 95833-2936, is 
hereby adopted by reference. One true copy of this code is on file in the office of the City Clerk 
and is available for public inspection as required by law. 

ARTICLE XI. CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE 

SEC. 14-17. CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE ADOPTED. 

The fifth part of eleven parts of the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, known as 
the California Plumbing Code ("CPC"), 2022 Edition, including Appendices A, B, D, I, and K 
thereof, and standards contained therein, published by the Building Standards Commission, 2525 
Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130, Sacramento CA 95833-2936, is hereby adopted by reference, 
subject to the amendment hereinafter set forth. One copy of this code is on file in the office of 
the City Clerk and is available for public inspection as required by law. 

SEC. 14-18. AMENDMENT. 

(A) Chapter One, Division II-Administration. Except for Sections 101.1, 101.2, and 
101.3, entitled "Title," "Purpose," and "Scope," Chapter One, Division II entitled 
"Administration" is hereby deleted from the CPC. The Administrative Code as adopted 
in the Oxnard City Code, Chapter 14, Article II, shall apply to this Article. 

ARTICLE XII. CALIFORNIA ENERGY CODE 

SEC. 14-19. CALIFORNIA ENERGY CODE ADOPTED. 

The sixth part of twelve parts of the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, known as 
the California Energy Code ("Energy Code"), 2022 Edition, including Appendices 1-A and 1-B, 
as published by the California Building Standards Commission, 2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 
130, Sacramento CA 95833-2936, is hereby adopted by reference. One true copy of this code is 
on file in the office of the City Clerk and is available for public inspection as required by law. 

27 
Ordinance No. 3021 



ARTICLE XIII. (RESERVED) 

ARTICLE XIV. (RESERVED) 

ARTICLE XV. CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE 

SEC. 14-24. CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE -ADOPTED. 

The California Fire Code ("CFC") 2022 Edition, including Appendix Chapter 4, 
Appendix B, Appendix C, Appendix D, Appendix F, and Appendix 0, published by the 
Building Standards Commission, 2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130, Sacramento CA 
95833-2936, is hereby adopted by reference, subject to the amendments, additions, and 
deletions hereinafter set forth. One copy of such code is on file in the office of the City 
Clerk and is available for public inspection as required by law. 

SEC. 14-25. AMENDMENTS 

(A) Chapter 1, Section [A] 101.1: Amend Section [A] 101.1 to read: 

IA] 101.1. Title. These regulations.shall be known as the Fire Code of the City of 
Oxnard, hereinafter referred to as "this code". 

(B) Chapter 1, Section [A] 103.1: Amend Section {Al 103.1 to read: 

[A] 103.1 Creation of agency. The Oxnard Fire Prevention Bureau is hereby created and 
the official in charge thereof shall be known as the fire code official. The function of the 
agency shall be the implementation, administration and enforcement of the provisions of 
this code. 

(C) Chapter 1, Section 104.13: Add Section 104.13 to read: 

104.13. General. When the chief finds in any building, on any premises, or on any lot or 
parcel combustible, hazardous or explosive materials or dangerous accumulations of 
rubbish; or finds unnecessary accumulations of wastepaper, boxes, shavings, or any 
highly flammable materials which are so situated as to endanger life or property; or finds 
obstructions to or on fire escapes, stairs, passageways, doors, or windows that reasonably 
tend to interfere with the operations of the Fire Department or the egress of the occupants 
of such building or premises; or finds that this code is being violated, the chief is 
authorized to issue orders as necessary for the enforcement of the fire prevention laws and 
ordinances governing the same and for the safeguarding of life and property from fire. 

(D) Chapter 1, Section 104.13: Add Section 104.13.1 to read: 

104.13.1. Cost Recovery. Where an emergency situation is caused or exacerbated by a 
willful act, a negligent act, or a violation of the Fire Code, Building Code, or any other 
applicable law, ordinance or regulation, the cost of mitigating and securing any 
emergency that is within the responsibility of the Fire Chief shall be charged against the 

28 
Ordinance No. 3021 



person who caused the emergency or who caused the circumstances leading to the 
creation of the emergency. Damages and expenses incurred by any public agency 
providing mutual aid shall constitute debt of such person and shall be collectible by the 
Fire Chief for proper distribution in the same manner as in the case of an obligation under 
contract expressed or implied. Expenses as stated above shall include, but not limited to, 
equipment and personnel committed and any payments required by the public agency to 
outside business firms requested by the public agency to mitigate or secure the 
emergency, monitor remediation; and clean up. 

(E) Chapter 1, Section 104.1:. Add.Section 104.14 to read: 

104.14. Stopping uses, evacuation. The chief is authorized to order an operation or use 
stopped, or the evacuation of any premises building or vehicle or portion thereof which 
has or is a fire hazard, hazardous condition or situation which presents a hazard to life or 
property. 

(F) Chapter 1, Section 105.5.54: Add Subsection 4 to read: 

4. Cannabis. An operational permit is required to dispense, test, distribute, grow, 
manufacture, or cultivate cannabis for commercial use. 

(G) Chapter 1, Section 105.5.54: Add Subsection 5 to read: 

5. Wood .and Wood Composite Pallet Manufacturing and Recycling Facilities. 
· Wood and wood composite pallet manufacturing and recycling facilities require 
an operational permit. 

(H) Chapter 1, Section 105.5.54: Add Subsection 6 to read: 

6. Electronic Gate Access. WhereJection 503.7 Electronic and Electric Access 
Gates applies, an operational permit is required. 

(I) Section [A] 112.4: Amend Section [A] 112.4 to read: 

[A] 112.4. Violation Penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall 
fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, 
repair, or do work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the 
fire code official, or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be 
guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable by a fine of not more than One Thousand Dollars 
($1,000.00) or by imprisonment not exceeding (6) months, or both such fine and 
imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served shall 
be deemed a separate offense. 

(J) Section 202: The following definitions are added or amended to read as follows: 

Fire Chief. The Chief Officer of the Fire Department serving the jurisdiction. 

29 
Ordinance No. 3021 



Fire Code Official. The fire chief or other member of the fire department appointed by 
the fire chief charged with the administration and enforcement of this code. 

Operational Fire Permit. An official document or certificate issued by the Oxnard Fire 
Department which authorizes performance of a specific activity. 

(K) Section 401.10: Add Section 401.10 to read: 

401.10. Immediate Reporting of a Release or a Threatened Release. Any person who 
stores, transports, dispenses, uses, or handles hazardous materials, or any facility required 
by Occupational Safety and Health Administration (OSHA) regulations to prepare or 
maintain a Material Safety Data Sheet (MSDS)/Safety Data Sheets (SDS), including those 
who store extremely hazardous substances shall provide an immediate, verbal report of 
any release or threatened release of a hazardous material to the City of Oxnard Fire 
Department accessing the 911 emergency reporting system without delay as soon as: 
1. a person has knowledge of the release or threatened release; 
a. notification can be provided without impeding immediate control of the release or 
threatened release; 
b. Notification can be provided without impeding immediate emergency medical 
measures. 
2. The immediate reporting pursuant to subsection # 1. of this section shall include, as a 
minimum: 
a. the exact location of the release or threatened release; 
b. the name of the person reporting the release or threatened release; 
c. the hazardous materials involved in the release or threatened release; 
d. an estimate of the quantity of hazardous materials involved; and 
e. if known, the potential hazards presented by the hazardous material involved in the 
release or threatened release. 

(L) Section 503.1.2.1: Add Section 503.1.2.1 to read: 

503.1.2.1. Difficult Apparatus Access. If the Fire Code Official determines that access 
for fire apparatus to any building or structure is unduly difficult, installation of an 
automatic fire-extinguisher system shall be required. 

(M) Section 503.2.1: Amend Section 503.2.1 to read: 

503.2.1. Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width of not 
less than 26 feet (7925 mm) and an unobstructed height of not less than 1~ feet 6 inches 
(4115 mm). 
Exceptions: 

1. Alleys without fire hydrants must have an unobstructed width of not less than 20 
feet (6096 mm). 

2. Approved security gates in accordance with Section 503.6. 

(N) Section 503.7: Add Section 503.7 to read: 

30 
Ordinance No: 3021 



503. 7. Electronic and Electric Access Gates. When access to or within a structure or 
area is impeded by an electronically or electrically secured opening or gate, such 
electronically or electrically secured opening or gate shall be constructed and maintained 
in accordance with plans approved by the Fire Code Official or Oxnard Police 
Department. The Fire Code Official or Oxnard Police Department shall not approve such 
plans unless the plans allow emergency vehicles and emergency personnel to open such 
electronically or electrically secured openings or gates by City approved radio equipment 
used by such emergency vehicles or personnel. 

On or before August 1, 2006, all existing electronically or electrically secured openings 
or gates that impede access to a structure or area shall either be (a) removed, or (b) 
constructed and maintained in accordance with plans approved by the Fire Code Official 
or Oxnard Police Department. 

For the purposes of this section 503. 7, "opening" shall be limited to an exterior door for a 
commercial or industrial building or a door on a commercial, industrial, or residential 
property that limits access to a common area that is an accessway to more than one 
commercial, industrial, or residential occupancy. 

(0) Section 503.7.1: Add Section 503.7.1 to read: 

503.7.1.Battery Backup. Electronic and Electric Access Gates shall be installed with 
battery back up to ensure :functionality in the case of power failure to the primary means 
of power. 

(P) Section 503.7.2: Add Section 503.7.2 to read: 

503. 7.2. Electronic and Electric Access Gates Maintenance. Electronic and Electric 
Access Gates shall be maintained in working order at all times. Inspections, testing and 
maintenance shall occur on an annual basis to verify proper functionality of Electronic 
and Electric Access Gates. Electronic and Electric Access Gates found to be not 
functioning properly shall be secured in a manner which ensures access at all times as 
needed. Notification of non working Electronic and Electric Access Gates shall be made 
to the fire code official at time of discovery. 

(Q) Section 503.7.3: Add Section 503.7.3 to read: 

503.7.3. Electronic and Electric Access Gates Maintenance Records. All contractors 
who service, test, install and/or maintain Electronic and Electric Access Gates within the 
city are required to enroll and utilize the designated and approved single-point repository 
service to file records of all system inspections, tests, and maintenance as required by the 
fire code official. This repository service shall be maintained electronically and provided 
to the fire code official through a third party inspection reporting system. Fees, as 
applicable, will be paid directly from the contractor to the approved single-point 
repository service vendor. It is the responsibility of the third party testing company to 
upload test data to the single-point repository within 30 days oftest completion 

31 
Ordinance No. 3021 



(R) Section 507.5: Amend Section 507.5 to read:. 

507.5. Fire Hydrant systems. Fire hydrant systems shall comply with Sections 507.5.1 
through 5 07 .5 .6 and Oxnard Fire Department published Standards and Appendix C or by 
an approved method. 

(S) Section 507.5.1.1: Amend Section 507.5.1.1 to read: 

507.5.1.1. Hydrant for standpipe systems. Buildings equipped with a standpipe system 
installed in accordance with Section 905 shall have a fire hydrant within 50 feet (15 m) of 
the fire department connections. · 

Exception: The distance shall be permitted to exceed 50 feet (15 m) where approved 
by the fire code official. 

(T) Section 901.6.3.2: Add Section 901.6.3.2 to read: 

901.6.3.2 System Records. All contractors or property owners who service, test, install 
and/or maintain fire protection systems and devices within the city are required to enroll 
and utilize the designated and approved single-point repository service to file records of 
all system inspections, tests, and maintenance required by the referenced standards. This 
repository service shall be maintained electronically and provided to the fire code official 
through a third party inspection reporting system. Fees, as applicable, will be paid 
directly from the Responsible Party to the approved single-point repository service 
vendor. It is the responsibility of the third party testing company to upload test data to 
the single-point repository within 30 days oftest completion. 

(lJ) Section 903.4.2.1: Add Section 903.4.2.1 to read: 

903.4.2.1. Exterior Strobe. Provide an approved exterior strobe, in an approved location, 
visible from the street or approach roadway or drive aisle. 

(V) Section 904.3.5: Amend Section 904.3.5 to read: 

904.3.5. Monitoring. Where a building fire alarm system, or a monitoring and alarm 
system complying with section 903.4, is installed, automatic fire-extinguishing systems 
shall be monitored by the building fire alarm system or the monitoring and alarm system 
in accordance with NFPA 72. 

(W) Section 906.1, #10. Add Section 906.1, #10 to read: 

10. As required by the Fire Code Official. 

(X) Section 907.3.5: Add Section 907.3.5 to read: 

32 
Ordinance No. 3021 



907.3.5. Fog or Smoke Emitting Systems. No system shall be installed in any 
building/structure or portion thereof, which discharges any gas, vapor, liquid or other 
product when the primary intent of system discharge is to obscure the vision, cause 
disorientation, or otherwise incapacitate any occupant of said building/structure or 
portion thereof. Nothing in this section is intended to preclude the installation of an 
approved fire suppression system. 

(Y) Section 907.5.2.3.5: Add Section 907.5.2.3.5 to read: 

907.5.2.3.5. Exterior Strobe. Provide an approved exterior strobe, in an approved 
location, visible from the street or approach roadway or drive aisle. 

(Z) Section 3901.1: Amend Section 3901.1 to read: 

3901.1. Scope. Plant cultivation, processing, or extraction facilities shall comply with this 
chapter and the California Building Code. The extraction process includes the act of 
extraction of the oils and fats by use of a solvent, desolventizing of the raw material, 
production of the miscella, distillation of the solvent from the miscella, and solvent 
recovery. The use, storage, transfilling, and handling of hazardous materials in these 
facilities shall comply with this chapter, other applicable provisions of this code, Chapter 
38 ofNFPA 1, and the California Building Code. 

(AA) Add Sections 4908 through 4908.9.1 to read: 

4908. VERY IDGH FIRE HAZARD SEVERITY ZONE-REQUIREMENTS 
SPECIFIC TO OXNARD. 

4908.1. Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone Established. The Very High Fire Hazard 
Severity Zone shall be established as set forth in Sections 4908.1.1 through4908.l.3. 

4908.1.1. Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone Ordinance and Map. The Very High 
Fire Hazard Severity Zones are hereby established and declared to be those districts and 
areas included within the boundary described and set forth in the most current map, 
ATTACHMENT A, which is incorporated herein and made a part hereof for all purposes 
and shall be available at the Fire Marshal's Office. 

FIGURE 4908.1.1 

VERY IDGH FIRE HAZARD SEVERITY ZONE MAP 

4908.1.2. Modified Boundary Lines. When in the course of improvement of 
undeveloped areas of the City, new streets, lots and building sites are created where none 
existed before, and such new streets, lots and building sites overlap the existing boundary 
line of the Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone, the boundary line of such zone shall be 

33 
Ordinance No. 3021 



deemed to be relocated to coincide with the property boundary or along the center line of 
such newly created streets that lie closest to the original boundary line location. 

4908.1.3. Legal Description. The Fire Code Official shall, by regulation, establish a legal 
description of the Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone. Such regulation shall be 
amended from time to time to reflect changes necessitated by Section 4908.1.2, or for 
other necessary purposes. Every such regulation of the Fire Code Official shall be 
established according to the requirements of Section 104 .1.1. 

4908.2. Posting of Signs Prohibiting Smoking and Burning. There shall be no open 
burning or smoking in the Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone. The Fire Code Official 
shall cause such districts to be posted at all times by suitable signs giving notice thereof. 

4908.3. Authority to Construct. Maintain and Close Fire Roads, Fire Trails and 
Firebreaks. The Fire Code Official shall have authority to construct fire roads and 
firebreaks in or upon any undeveloped lands in any mountain or hill area, whether or not 
such lands are public or private, with the consent of the owner thereof, and to maintain 
the same on a permanent basis when the Fire Code Official determines that such fire 
roads and firebreak are necessary for the protection of life and property against fire or 
panic. 

4908.3.1. Authority to Secure. The Fire Code Official may install gates or cables, and 
securely lock the same, to prevent the use by unauthorized persons of any fire road, truck 
trail or other road which is not a public highway and over which the Fire Department has 
the right to pass, whether by easement, license, City ownership or otherwise, for purposes 
relating to fire protection or control. 

4908.4. Authority in Public Lands. All lands within the limits of the City of Oxnard and 
lying within the boundaries of any State or Federal lands may be closed to the public by 
the Fire Chief or by any duly authorized State or Federal officer, provided such closure is 
not in conflict with any State or Federal law. No person shall enter upon any lands so 
closed except by valid Special Permit from the Fire Code Official pursuant to Section 
105. 8. Notice of such closure shall be deemed sufficient when provided pursuant to 
Section 4908.8.1. 

Exception: 
Closure of private lands shall not prohibit the use or entry upon such lands by the owner, 
his guests or invitees, provided such guests or invitees have written permission of the 
owner of such private lands to enter upon the same. 

4908.5. Open Flame Prohibited. There shall be no open flame or self-contained device 
capable of producing flame permitted or located upon any road, street or fire road within 
the Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone. 

4908.6. Smoking Prohibited. It shall be unlawful for any person to light, ignite or 
smoke any cigar, cigarette, tobacco in a pipe or other form of smoldering substance 
within the Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone. 

34 
Ordinance No. 3021 



4908.7. Clearance of Vegetative Growth From Electrical Transmission Lines. Any 
person owning, leasing, controlling, operating or maintaining any electrical transmission 
line over any mountainous forest, brush, or hazardous vegetation covered land shall at all 
times cut, trim, or otherwise remove all forked, dead, decadent, rotten, diseased, or 
weakened branches of trees, or trees that may contact or fall upon any transmission line. 
Live trees shall remain pruned and trimmed to prevent exposure to electrical transmission 
or branch lines. 

4908.8. Restricted Entry or Presence in the Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone. 
Any person who enters or is present in the Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone, except 
upon public roadways, inhabited areas, or established trails and campsites open to the 
public, is committing a trespass. Notice of said offense shall be deemed sufficient where 
provided pursuant to Section 4908.8.1. 

Exceptions: 
This subsection shall not prohibit residents or owners of private property or their invitees 
or guests from going to or from such private property, provided that such invitees or 
guests have the permission of the owner or resident to be in or upon such private 
property. 

This subsection shall not restrict any public officer in the pursuit of his/her duty. 

4908.8.1. Notice. For purposes of Sections 4908 through 4908.9.1, notice may be given 
as follows: 

Posted Property. By posted signs identifying the property closed to the public within the 
Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone, bearing the words "PROPERTY CLOSED TO 
THE PUBLIC-TRESPASSING FORBIDDEN BY LAW" in letters not less than 3 
inches in height, at the entrance thereto and along all exterior boundaries at equal 
intervals not less than three to the mile, and at all roads and trails entering the property; or 

Personal Notice. By personal notice given directly to a person found in an area of the 
Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone closed to the public, advising the person that the 
area is closed to the public and that if the person refuses or fails immediately to leave the 
closed area, or if the person leaves and returns, the person's presence in the non-public 
area constitutes trespassing. 

4908.8.2. Trespass. No person shall travel or trespass upon any identified Fire Hazard 
Severity Zone. 

4908.8.3. Special Permit. No person shall operate, drive or park any motorcycle, motor 
scooter or other vehicle within the Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone, except upon 
clearly established public or private roads, without first having secured a Special Permit 
from the Fire Code Official pursuant to Section 105.8. 

35 
Ordinance No. 3021 



4908.8.4. Unauthorized Parking. No unauthorized person shall park any vehicle so as 
to obstruct the entrance to any identified Fire Hazard Severity Zone. 

4908.9. Tampering With Established Locks, Signs, Barriers, or Water Tanks. No 
person, except one authorized and acting within the scope of his official duties, shall 
unlock, open, damage, or tamper with or cause to be unlocked, opened, damaged, or 
tampered with any lock, gate, door, barrier, seal, water tank enclosure, water valve, 
hydrant, or other fire protection equipment or facility installed by or under control of the 
designated Fire Authority. 

4908.9.1. Defacing Signs. No person, except one authorized and acting within the scope 
of his official duties, shall remove, deface, mar, mutilate, or change the position of any 
sign, installed by the Fire Code Official pursuant to this article, designating "CLOSED 
AREA," ''NO SMOKING," ''NO OPEN FIRES," "RESTRICTED ENTRY," or other sign 
or device installed to give warning and to regulate persons' actions within the Very High 
Fire Hazard Severity Zone. 

(BB) Section B105: Amend Table B105.2 to read: 

Table B105.2. Column two - Minimum Fire-flow, Row two of three: 
50% of the value in Table B105.1(2? 
Table B105.2. Column two - Minimum Fire-flow, Row three of three: 
50% of the value in Table B105.1(2l 

(CC) Section D102.1: Amend Section D102.1, to read: 

D102.1. Access and loading. Facilities, buildings or portions of buildings hereafter 
constructed shall be accessible to fire department apparatus by way of an approved fire 
apparatus access road with an asphalt, concrete of or approved driving surface capable of 
supporting the imposed load of frre apparatus weighing at least 76,000 pounds (34,550 
kg). 

(DD) Section D103.5 #1: Amend Section D103.5 #1, to read: 

#1. Where a single gate is provided, the gate width shall be not less than 20 feet (6096 
mm). Where a frre apparatus road consists of a divided roadway, the gate width shall 
be not less than 15 feet (4572 mm). 

ARTICLE XVI. FIRE SPRINKLERS 

SEC. 14-26. AUTOMATIC FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEM. 

The California Fire Code ("CFC") 2022 Edition, Section 903, Automatic Sprinkler Systems, is 
hereby amended. 

(A) Section 903.1.2: Add Section 903.1.2 to read as follows: 

36 
Ordinance No. 3021 



903.1.2. Definitions. The following words and terms shall, for the purposes of section 
903, have the following meanings: 
Bathroom. A room or compartment containing one or more of the following: a toilet, a 
tub, or a shower. 

(B) Section 903.2: Amend Section 903.2 to read as follows: 

903.2. Where required. Approved automatic fire sprinkler systems shall be installed in 
all structures, occupancies, and locations as set forth in this section. For the purposes of 
this section, fire walls, fire barriers, and fire partitions shall not be considered as creating 
separate buildings. 

(C) Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.21: Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.21 are deleted 
in their entirety and sections 903.2.1, 903.2.2, and 903.2.3 are added as follows: 

903.2.1. New Construction. Automatic fire sprinkler systems shall be installed, 
maintained, and accessible for service in all new buildings, regardless of location, floor 
area, construction type, or occupancy. 

Exceptions: 
1. Spaces and areas in telecommunications buildings used exclusively for 

telecommunications equipment, associated electrical power distribution 
equipment, batteries and standby engines, provided those spaces or areas 
are equipped throughout with an automatic fire alarm system and are 
separated from the remainder of the building by fire barriers consisting of 
not less than I-hour fire-resistance-rated walls and 2-hour 
fire-resistance-rated floor/ceiling assemblies. 

2. Automatic fire sprinkler protection for fixed guideway transit systems 
shall be as per Section 903.2.17 

3. The Fire Code Official is authorized to make an exception for trash 
enclosures that are of non-combustible construction including the roof or 
cover, and at least ten (10) feet from any adjacent structure, and at least 
five (5) feet from the nearest property line. 

4. The Fire Code Official is authorized to make an exception for carports, 
storage sheds, and similar structures having less than 500 square feet of 
roof area including overhangs, if the structure is least ten (10) feet from 
any adjacent structure, and at least five (5) feet from the nearest property 
line. 

5. The Fire Code Official is authorized to make an exception for structures of 
non-combustible construction that do not have occupiable space, and that 
have no storage, insignificant fire load, and no exposures. 

37 
Ordinance No. 3021 



903.2.2. Ambulatory care facilities. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed 
throughout the entire structure containing an ambulatory care facility where either of the 
following conditions exist at any time: 

I. Four or more care recipients are incapable of self-preservation, whether rendered 
incapable by staff or staff has accepfed responsibility for care recipients already 
incapable. 

2. One or more care recipients that are incapable of self-preservation are located at 
other than the level of exit discharge serving such a facility. 

903.2.3. Existing Construction. Automatic fire sprinkler systems shall be installed, 
maintained, and accessible for service throughout existing structures and additions in the 
following situations. 

I. Whenever there is a change in occupancy in the structure or change in use 
classification to a higher or more hazardous occupancy or use classification based 
on the Building Code classifications or as determined by the Fire Code Official. 

2. Whenever permits for additions or alterations result in an increase of cumulative 
area of more than 1,000 square feet of total structure area, including mezzanines 
and additional stories. Additional area determination shall be cumulative, from 
the effective date of this ordinance: December 27, 2007. Sprinkler coverage shall 
include the entire existing structure, garage(s), and adjacent accessory structures. 

3. In rooms where nitrate film is stored or handled. 

4. In protected combustible fiber storage vaults as defined in this code. 

5. When more than 75% of the existing ceiling is removed or exposed then the entire 
structure must be retrofitted with an NFPA 13 compliant Fire Sprinkler System. 

6. Occupancies that require a cannabis permit to operate. 

(D) Remove Section 903.3.1.1.2 in its entirety. 

(E) Section 903.3.1.2. Add sections 903.3.1.2.4 through 903.3.1.2.7 to read: 

903.3.1.2.4. Overhangs. Sprinkler protection is required under exterior roofs, canopies, 
and overhangs over four (4) feet in width. 

Exceptions: 
1. The Fire Code Official is authorized to make exception where the 

construction is non-combustible or limited combustible, and, where no 
combustibles are stored or handled, and, the area is at least 50 percent 
open. 

38 
Ordinance No. 3021 



903.3.1.2.5. Under stairs. Sprinkler protection is required for usable spaces and 
compartments under stairs, including bathrooms and closets. 

903.3.1.2.6. Attics, crawl spaces, concealed spaces. Attics, crawl spaces, and normally 
unoccupied concealed spaces that do not contain fuel-fired appliances do not require 
sprinkler coverage. In attics, crawl spaces, and normally unoccupied concealed spaces 
that contain fuel-fired equipment, a sprinkler shall be installed above the equipment; 
however, sprinklers shall not be required in the remainder of the space. 

903.3.1.2. 7. Ceiling obstructions. Pendant sprinklers within 3 feet of the center of a 
ceiling fan, surface-mounted ceiling luminaire or similar object shall be considered to be 
obstructed, anc;l additional sprinklers shall be installed. Sidewall sprinklers within 5 feet 
of the center of a ceiling fan, surface-mounted ceilingluminaire or similar object shall be 
considered to be obstructed, and additional sprinklers shall be installed. 

(F) Section 903.3.1.3. Add sections 903.3.1.3.1 through 903.3.1.3.4 to read: 

903.3.1.3.1. Overhangs. Sprinkler protection is required under exterior roofs, canopies, 
and overhangs over four ( 4) feet in width. 

Exceptions: 
1. The Fire Code Official is authorized to make exception where the 

construction is non-combustible or limited combustible, and, where no 
combustibles are stored or handled, and, the area is at least 50 percent 
open. 

903.3.1.3.2. Under stairs. Sprinkler protection is required for usable spaces and 
compartments under stairs, including bathrooms and closets. 

903.3.1.3.3. Attics, crawl spaces, concealed spaces. Attics, crawl spaces, and normally 
unoccupied concealed spaces that do not contain fuel-fired appliances do not require 
sprinkler coverage. In attics, crawl spaces, and normally unoccupied concealed spaces 
that contain fuel-fired equipment, a sprinkler shall be installed above the equipment; 
however, sprinklers shall not be required in the remainder of the space. 

903.3.1.3.4. Ceiling obstructions. Pendant sprinklers within 3 feet of the center of a 
ceiling fan, surface-mounted ceiling luminaire or similar object shall be considered to be 
obstructed, and additional sprinklers shall be installed. Sidewall sprinklers within 5 feet 
of the center of a ceiling fan, surface-mounted ceiling luminaire or similar object shall be 
considered to be obstructed, and additional sprinklers shall be installed. 

39 
Ordinance No. 3021 



PART 4. The City Council, following due consideration, hereby finds and determines that all 
the amendments, deletions, and additions to the forgoing California Building Standards Code and 
other codes are due to the following local conditions: 

(A) Climatic 
I. The City experiences periods of high temperatures accompanied by low 
humidity and high winds each year. The City also experiences periods of intense 
rainfall, which creates the need for special drainage precautions. Close proximity to 
the ocean may accelerate some building components to erode, corrode, decay, and 
expose beach homes to ocean wave force and damp corrosive microclimates. 

2. During the months October through March, the City experiences wind 
conditions known as the "Santa Ana" winds. These very strong, hot, dry 
northeasterly winds considerably aid the spread of fire and create a strong possibility 
of a conflagration in all structures during this period. During these wind conditions, 
much of the Fire Department's resources are used to combat life safety problems such 
as downed power lines. The Fire Department is forced to provide standby protection 
for extended periods because the electric utility is overloaded with high priority calls. 
The Fire Department equipment used on these non-firefighting calls is, therefore, not 
available for response to structure fires. Thus, even a fire in one structure not 
immediately extinguished such as by a fire sprinkler system could spread and cause 
significant property damage and/or loss of life. 

3. Although there are few brush or forest areas within the City, the Fire 
Department receives requests for aid from jurisdictions involved in firefighting these 
types of fires outside the City. This response leaves the City's firefighting resources 
at a lower than normal level and impacts the Fire Department's ability to promptly 
respond to structure fires when they occur at the same time. 

4. During the hot, dry wind period, the number of outside fires, such as trash and 
grass fires, increases dramatically. These fires do not pose a serious threat to life or 
property, but do occupy firefighting resources and seriously impact the Fire 
Department's ability to respond to structure fires when they occur at the same time. 

(B) Geological 
l. The City is located in close proximity to 3 major fault systems capable of 
producing earthquakes ranging from 6.7 to 7.3 in magnitude, and has been 
determined by the State of California Seismic Hazards Mapping program to be 
underlain by soil layers that are prone to liquefaction failure. Special seismic design, 
construction, and inspection considerations must be in place to provide a reasonable 
degree of structural integrity for buildings constructed in these areas. Additionally, 
the potential for multiple fires occurring simultaneously after a large seismic event 
will tax available firefighting resources. Built-in fire protection will assist in 
extinguishing or controlling fires. 

2. The City is located in an area with expansive soils, high groundwater table, 
and ocean frontage. Special foundation considerations and soils analysis 

40 
Ordinance No. 3021 



requir~ments must be in place to provide a reasonable degree of structural integrity 
for buildings constructed in these areas. 

(C) Topographical 
1. The City has flat land and waterfront developments that require special 
drainage and coastal precautions. Structures would be subject to water damage 
without special requirements addressing site drainage and coastal wave and wind 
forces. 

2. During the rainy season, from December through April, the City is subject to 
flooding, making various parts of the City inaccessible to firefighting equipment on 
short notice. This prolongs the Fire Department's response time to structure fires. 

3. The City is on a flat, coastal plain, and is in a tsunami inundation zone. 
Additionally, many of the evacuat~on routes from this zone pass through the City. 
The arrival time of a tsunami may be predicted, but not its magnitude. Therefore, 
evacuation measures may be taken, but the entire area is defenseless when it strikes. 
During and after a tsunami, these coastal areas will not be easily accessible to 
firefighting and other emergency equipment. 

The City Council further finds that such amendments, deletions, and additions are 
necessary to best serve the public health and welfare. The City Council further finds and 
determines that all the amendments, deletions, and additions are also required for the reasons set 
forth in the Index and Summary to Model Codes and Amendments, which is attached hereto and 
incorporated herein as Exhibit A. 

PART 5. The City Attorney, who was designated to prepare a summary of this ordinance, 
has determined that it is not feasible to prepare a fair and adequate summary thereof. The City 
Council thus orders that a display advertisement of at least one quarter page containing the 
information required by Government Code Section 36933(c)(2) be published in a newspaper of 
general circulation in the City at least five days prior to adoption of this ordinance, and another 
such display advertisement be similarly published within 15 days after its adoption, including the 
names of the Councilmembers voting for and against the ordinance. 

41 
Ordinance No. 3021 



PART 6. This ordinance was introduced for first reading on this 01st day of 2022, 
and passed on November 2022, by the following roll call vote and shall take effect thirty 
days after final passage. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED this 15th day of November 2022, by the fo llowing vote: 

AYES: Counci l members Basua, MacDonald, Perel l o, Teran and Zaragoza 

NOES: None . 

ABSENT: Council member Madrigal 

ABSTAIN: None . 

ATTEST: 

APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

42 
Ordinance No. 302 1 


